12/6/2021 FW: Quote from A-1 Concrete Leveling - Nov 15, 2021

Subject: FW: Quote from A-1 Concrete Leveling - Nov 15, 2021
Date: 11/17/2021 9:58:39 AM Mountain Standard Time

From: ren@zandrmgmt.com

To: barbabudd@outlook.com, rreder46@aol.com, pjl80917@gmail.com
Cc: darren@zandrmgmt.com

Hi all,

Here is the proposal for the concrete levelling from A-1.

I am working on having the concrete replacement bid re=submitted so that you can see the price of each individual area on the proposal. I have also asked that the
contractor come back and mark each area on the bid so that you know what you are looking at.

I hope that is helpful.

Very Respectfully,

Ren Gall

Property Manager Assistant
(719) 594-0506

ren@zandrmgmt.com

PrROPERTY
MANAGEMENT

From: A-1 Concrete Leveling <notification@getjobber.com>
Sent: Monday, November 15, 2021 7:41 PM

To: Ren Gall <ren@zandrmgmt.com>

Subject: Quote from A-1 Concrete Leveling - Nov 15, 2021

Estimate

Hi Z & R Property Management for Ren Gall,

Hey Ren. These are all discounted HOA rates. If we get fast approved we will do everything we can to get it in this season. We are very lucky to still be wor
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1216/2021 FW: Quote from A-1 Concrete Leveling - Nov 15, 2021

shut down for Dec 10th weather permitting. That is about a week later than we usually have to shut down for freezing temps. We don’t have many slots ope
Also | can't remember where water hook ups are here. | think that was an issue in the past. Do you know where water hook ups are. In the parking garage

Thank you for asking us to quote your project. If there is more than one option on your bid just click on the items you would like completed and that will upd
approved and it will come back to us to contact you to set up a date and time for the work to be completed.

The quote total for all the work bid is $2,583.00 as of Nov 15, 2021. See the estimate for details and break down of price and services we are offering.

If you have any questions or concerns regarding this quote, please don't hesitate to get in touch with us at A1( @a1southcolorado.com or reply to the quote *
is a little harder for us to reply faster. Just a message is best.

Sincerely,

A-1 Concrete Leveling % / gﬁ
p- ; /
/

Button not working? Copy and paste this link to your browser address bar: https://clienthub.getiobber.com/client_hubs/289adf99-9bde-462d-8fd2-6 ch37d742a6/quotes/14087319.html?
auth tlen=gy,1hg§§ig2iJIUzl1NiJ9.eyJidW5rZX,1fQXNIcIQQZCIBNDQ&’NzgxMzggImRIbQVnYXR/I/'meszZXO.iBMwaOV&Bm§7ngfe Vbyktse UieQb57XwYMLZnzfl&comm_channel=email&comm _type=qu

A-1 Concrete Leveling
719-536-0556
al@a1lsouthcolorado.com

2515 Laramie Dr. Ste 150
Colorado Springs, Colorado 80910
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